
From:                                         Wahlman, Jason <jason.wahlman@mercer.com>
Sent:                                           Tuesday, November 16, 2021 1:21 PM
To:                                               Smith, Rick
Cc:                                               Brown, Holly M
Subject:                                     RE: [External] RE: ID/A residential updates
 
Hi Rick,
 
Thank you for sending the selected fees. We are planning to send the PDS fee ranges this week and would like to send them
along with the AWC monthly admin fee range if possible. You had mentioned when we spoke on Friday that you had some
provider feedback and ODP decisions to share on the admin fee assumptions. Do you have any updates on whether the non‐
ERE assumptions for the AWC monthly admin fee need to be adjusted (staffing ratio, transportation, occupancy, and training)?
 
Thank you,
Jason
 

From: Smith, Rick < > 
Sent: Tuesday, November 16, 2021 11:36 AM
To: Brown, Holly M <holly.brown@mercer.com>
Cc: Wahlman, Jason <jason.wahlman@mercer.com>
Subject: RE: [External] RE: ID/A residential updates
 
 

CAUTION: This email originated outside the company. Do not click links or open attachments unless you are expecting them from the
sender.

 
Good afternoon,
Attached are the selected fees for the fiscal analysis.  We will not be changing res ineligible until 7/1/22.  Do you have an idea
when PDS will be done?
Thanks
 

From: Brown, Holly M <holly.brown@mercer.com> 
Sent: Friday, November 12, 2021 8:19 AM
To: Smith, Rick 
Cc: Wahlman, Jason <jason.wahlman@mercer.com>
Subject: Re: [External] RE: ID/A residential updates
 
Thanks Rick. Yes, we have an email we are finalizing for you with the PDS assumptions so we can wrap up the fee ranges. We
will get that over to you this morning. Should we find time today to discuss? We could also be available Monday late afternoon
or Tuesday.
 
Get Outlook for iOS

From: Smith, Rick 
Sent: Friday, November 12, 2021 8:09:30 AM
To: Brown, Holly M <holly.brown@mercer.com>
Cc: Wahlman, Jason <jason.wahlman@mercer.com>
Subject: RE: [External] RE: ID/A residential updates
 
 

CAUTION: This email originated outside the company. Do not click links or open attachments unless you are expecting them from the
sender.

 



Good morning,
We should probably have a chat about the PDS ranges as well.  We were contemplating a few adjustments on the assumptions
there (productivity and supplies).
Thanks
 

From: Brown, Holly M <holly.brown@mercer.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, November 10, 2021 8:54 PM
To: Smith, Rick 
Cc: Wahlman, Jason <jason.wahlman@mercer.com>; Brown, Holly M <holly.brown@mercer.com>
Subject: RE: [External] RE: ID/A residential updates
 
Hi Rick,
 
Sorry for the delay in response. Yes, we can review the most recent transportation cost report template (updated in January 2021 per
Agnes’ request) and identify the necessary updates. A couple of questions:
 

1. Is ODP collecting costs for all 12 months of SFY 2021 (July 1, 2020-June 30, 2021) or just the last 6 months of the SFY? The
last version of the cost report distributed by Agnes collected costs through 12/31/2020.

2. When does ODP plan to request that the provider submit the cost report? The due date is listed on the first tab of the template –
we can populate it or leave that for ODP to complete.

 
Thanks,
Holly
 
 
 
Holly Brown
Principal, Mercer Government, North America
T +1 612 642 8620  M +1 612 286 7688
 
Assistant: Raissa Rosado raissa.rosado@mercer.com 
 
Mercer Government, 333 South 7th Street, Suite 1400, Minneapolis, MN 55402
www.mercer‐government.mercer.com
 

 

welcome to brighter
 
A business of Marsh McLennan
 

From: Smith, Rick <  
Sent: Wednesday, November 10, 2021 8:35 AM
To: Wahlman, Jason <jason.wahlman@mercer.com>
Cc: Brown, Holly M <holly.brown@mercer.com>
Subject: RE: [External] RE: ID/A residential updates
 
 

CAUTION: This email originated outside the company. Do not click links or open attachments unless you are expecting them from the
sender.

 
Thanks.  I think we are good with this.  Could you please check into the Transport‐Trip cost report form?  I want to release that
again for costs thru 6/30/21 for providers who have not chosen to accept fee schedule.
 

From: Wahlman, Jason <jason.wahlman@mercer.com> 







 
 

This email and any attachments may be confidential or proprietary. Any review, use, disclosure, distribution or copying of this email is
prohibited except by or on behalf of the intended recipient. If you received this message in error or are not the intended recipient, please
delete or destroy the email message and any attachments or copies and notify the sender of the erroneous delivery by return email. To
the extent that this message or its attachments were sent without encryption, we cannot guarantee that the contents have not been
changed or tampered with. Any advice expressed in this message is being delivered to you solely for your use in connection with the
matters addressed herein and may not be used for any other purpose without our prior written consent.
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